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U N I V E R S I T Y  O F  E A S T E R N  F I N L A N D

Turning Trash into Treasure

Turning Trash into Treasure rethinks, resuses 
and reinvents waste materials to bring about 
sustainability and positive change. A 
collaboration between the University of 
Eastern Finland and the University of 
Namibia , this project showcases how 
transforming waste creates environmental, 
social, and economic benefits – turning 
challenges into opportunities. 

In 2021, a skills audit conducted in 9 Namibian 
Correctional Facilities uncovered artistic 
talents amongst inmates. With high 
unemployment and poverty fueling crime in 
Namibia, this initiative provides social 
entrepreneurship and circular economy 
training to empower inmates, break cycles of 
poverty and support their integration into 
society. 

Through a circular economy appoach, these 
institutions transform solid waste into valuable  
art and crafts. 

Promoting positive change in prisons leads to 
better outcomes not only for indivudals but 
society!

Empowering Through Entrepreunership and 
Resilience

The project highlights the importance of 
rethinking, reusing, and reinventing discarded 
materials. This transformative approach boosts 
creativity and resilience while promoting 
community-wide positive change.  

Our project captures Namibian inmates’ 
experiences in solid waste management, framed 
by a community education model and eco-
social sustainability. Through education and 
engagement, the project encurages sustainable 
practices and social transformation. 

Equipping inmates with skills promotes 
successful reintegration , reduces recidivism, 
and contributes to safer communities and a 
sustainable future for all. 

Read more on our blogpost here. 

M O R E  I N F O R M A T I O N

See our project website here. 

Revitalizing Waste, Reshaping Futures: 

A Finnish-Namibian Initiative 

https://blogs.uef.fi/puheenvuoroja/2024/05/20/from-trash-to-treasure-empowering-prisoners-with-entrepreneurial-skills-in-arts-and-crafts-in-namibia/
https://uefconnect.uef.fi/en/group/social-enterprises-for-innovations-in-environmental-sustainability-africa-finland-ses/
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